
Claims of professional negligence against engineers rarely reach the Supreme Court of Canada. 
However, it recently decided two such cases, establishing legal precedents that will affect 
engineers involved in construction projects. This article outlines the cases and provides advice 
on how to avoid professional liability in construction work.
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The cases involve Ontario and British 
Columbia construction projects, in 
which contractors filed suits against con­
sulting engineers. Before reading the Su­
preme Court’s decision on each case, you 
may wish to form your own opinion 
about the consulting engineer’s liability. 
But be prepared to be surprised.
Engineers’ Liability for Plans
and Specs_________________________

The British Columbia Department of 
Highways retained N.D. Lea and Associ­
ates Ltd. to prepare plans and specifica­
tions for a 19.4-kilometre highway 
relocation project’s tender and contract 
documents. Edgeworth Construction 
Ltd. was awarded a $7-million contract 
for a 6.8-km stretch of the highway pro­
ject. Half of the contract amount was for 
the excavation of solid rock at a stipu­
lated unit price.

After construction was completed, 
Edgeworth filed a $21-million suit 
against N.D. Lea, alleging that it lost 
money due to errors in the firm’s speci­
fications and drawings. Edgeworth did 
not sue the highways department di­
rectly, because it was naturally con­
cerned this would prevent it from 
obtaining further work from the depart­
ment. Through extra work orders, unit 
price charges and other contract proce­
dures, the contractor was paid about $19 
million instead of the $7 million speci­
fied in the original contract.

N.D. Lea brought a pretrial motion to 
dismiss Edgew orth’s claim on the 
grounds that even if Edgeworth could 
prove that it incurred substantial eco­
nomic loss by relying on N.D. Lea’s en­
gineering work, its claim had no legal 
basis. N.D. Lea argued that its contract

was with the highways department and 
not Edgeworth. It further argued that 
Edgeworth’s contract with the depart­
ment stated that Edgeworth had investi­
gated  and sa tisfied  itse lf  about 
construction site conditions, and was not 
relying on any plans, specifications or 
other information provided by the de­
partment, including N.D. Lea’s engineer­
ing work. The firm also pointed out that 
since it did not supervise site construc­
tion, it was unable to ensure that con­
struction had been carried out according 
to its drawings and specifications.
Court Overturns Decision____________

Although the trial court and Court of 
Appeal found in favour of N.D. Lea, the 
Supreme Court overturned their judg­
ments, holding that the engineer had a 
duty of care to the contractor.1 It based 
its decision on a 1964 case decided by the 
British House of Lords, which deter­
mined that "a person who produces a 
report, knowing that another person may 
be relying on it, may be liable if that other 
person in fact relies on the report to 
his/her detriment, even if there is no con-

9tractual relationship between them." 
The Court found that Edgeworth’s reli­
ance was reasonable because N.D. Lea 
knew it would be relying on tender docu­
ments in preparing its bid. The contract 
between the highways department and 
Edgeworth did not change this fact.

"a person who produces a report, 
knowing that another person 

may be relying on it, 
may be liable ...

Further, the Court found that the de­
sign work was a representation by N.D. 
Lea, and did not cease to be so merely 
because the highways department incor­
porated it into the tender package. It in­
terp re ted  the exclusion  clause in 
Edgeworth’s contract with the depart­
ment strictly, determining that it applied 
only to the department and not N.D. Lea. 
In rendering its decision, the Court was 
particularly concerned about setting a le­
gal precedent that would cause success­
ful bidders not to rely on engineering 
designs supplied with tenders, requiring 
them to redo engineering work. In addi­
tion, the Court found it significant that 
the short tender period required bidders 
to rely on tender documents to prepare 
their bids.
Engineers’ Liability To Warn
of Need for Permits_________________

The South Nation River Conservation 
Authority decided to deepen a river run­
ning through the Ottawa Valley, and re­
tained Kostuch Engineering Limited to 
prepare the tender documents. The pro­
ject proceeded in six stages. The author­
ity put the sixth stage out for tender four 
months after retaining Kostuch; Auto 
Concrete Curb Ltd. was the successful 
bidder for this stage. Although conven­
tional draglines and backhoes had been 
used to remove earth during the first five 
stages of the project, Auto Concrete’s bid 
was based on using a suction dredge and 
settling lagoon for removal, which was 
less expensive. Kostuch advised the con­
tractor that it did not object to the use of 
this removal method, provided the re­
quired provincial environmental approv­
als were obtained. Ultimately, Auto 
Concrete was unable to obtain these ap­
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provals and had to use the conventional 
removal method instead, thereby incur­
ring substantial cost overruns.

Auto Concrete filed a suit against the 
authority and Kostuch to recover its cost 
overruns, alleging that Kostuch’s failure 
to include all relevant information in the 
tender documents constituted a negligent 
misrepresentation. It argued that a rea­
sonable and competent engineer would 
have considered that the successful bid­
der might want to use the suction dredg­
ing method, and therefore provided 
information on the required permits. 
Auto Concrete also argued that Kostuch 
knew bidders had only a short time to 
prepare their bids and should have antici­
pated that they would be relying on infor­
mation supplied with the tender. Kostuch 
countered that it had no duty of care to 
warn the contractor of the need for per­
mits, and that it was the contractor’s re­
sponsibility to choose its own work 
methods.
Decision Again Overturned__________

Although the three Ontario Court of 
Appeal judges who heard the case found 
in favour of Auto Concrete, all seven 
Supreme Court judges hearing it over­
turned their decision. This turn of events 
indicates that this is a difficult area of 
construction case law, in which even ex­
perienced judges can reach different con­
clusions.

"... the Court relied 
on the established legal 

principle that contractors 
are responsible 

for their own work methods."

In rendering its decision, the Supreme 
Court held that, unless there are specific 
arrangements to the contrary, the method 
by which contractors choose to execute 
work falls within their own sphere of 
responsibility.3 It found that neither own­
ers nor design professionals employed

by owners have any duty to advise con­
tractors about which work method to 
choose, or how to accomplish the work 
using the chosen method. Although some 
consulting engineers advise contractors 
about required permits, they are not le­
gally required to do so. Accordingly, the 
claim against Kostuch and the authority 
was dismissed.
Limiting Liability__________________

In the Edgeworth case, the Supreme 
Court extended an engineer’s duty of 
care to include contractors who suffer 
economic loss resulting from inaccura­
cies in engineering plans and specifica­
tions. However, the Auto Concrete 
decision makes it clear that this liability 
is not automatic. In the Auto Concrete 
case, the Court relied on the established 
legal principle that contractors are re­
sponsible for their own work methods. 
So although engineers may clearly be 
held liable for damages incurred by con­
tractors, engineers’ actual liability will 
depend on the facts of each case.

In the Edgeworth case, the Supreme 
Court recommended specific measures 
the engineering firm could have taken to 
protect itself from liability. These in­
cluded:
- placing a disclaimer of responsibility 

on construction design documents;
- refusing to provide a construction de­

sign without ongoing site supervision 
duties, and

- holding substantial liability insurance 
and building its cost into engineering 
fees.
As further protection, consulting en­

gineers can request that clients indem­
nify them against potential claims by 
contractors and other third parties. They 
can also have clients agree to limits on 
their professional liability, since damage 
awards can quickly exceed the limits of 
even the largest liability insurance pol­
icy. As a last resort, consulting engineers 
could turn down work they believe could 
put them at significant risk of profes­

sional liability. It may be worthwhile for 
engineering firms to review their con­
tracting procedures in light of these sug­
gestions. A useful text on professional 
liability in construction and other legal 
topics of interest to engineers was co­
authored by Madam Justice McLachlin, 
who wrote both the Edgeworth and Auto 
Concrete Decisions.4

"... litigation is probably 
the worst way to resolve 
construction disputes ...

Perhaps the most important lesson 
that can be learned from these two cases 
is that litigation is probably the worst 
way to resolve construction disputes: 
both cases took about 12 years to reach 
the Supreme Court; the Edgeworth case 
is expected to be retried yet again. To 
avoid litigation, consulting engineers 
should consider including alternative 
dispute resolution clauses in construc­
tion contracts and encourage own-
to do likewise.
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